

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF December 21, 2011

PAGE: 1A
 DATE: 01/04/12

CONTRACT IR-33737-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500448 DBE GOAL: 7.00
 DESCRIPTION: NEW INTERSTATE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 88,750,000.00 (A + B)
 CALL: 171 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM SR 45 TO SR 54, ON SR 54 TO CARMICHAEL ROAD
 AND AT THE INTERSECTION OF SR 45, SR 445 AND CONNECTOR
 COUNTY: GREENE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0001 HMA MAINLINE			\$ 2,971,993.83			
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0002 PCCP MAINLINE			\$ 1,897,162.61			
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0003 HMA INTERSECTION 45/445			\$ 251,831.13			
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0004 PCCP INTERSECTION 45/445			\$ 167,972.32			
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC SECTION 0001 HMA MAINLINE	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	NO BID			
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC SECTION 0002 PCCP MAINLINE	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	\$ 8,807,206.61	R		
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC SECTION 0003 HMA INTERSECTION 45/445	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	NO BID			
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC SECTION 0004 PCCP INTERSECTION 45/445	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	\$ 863,495.84	R		
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC SECTION 0005 COMMON ITEMS	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	\$ 88,210,421.81	R		B = \$ 2,125,000.00
32-0289822	KOLB GRADING LLC SECTION 0001 HMA MAINLINE	ST CHARLES MO	636-441-0200	NO BID			
32-0289822	KOLB GRADING LLC SECTION 0002 PCCP MAINLINE	ST CHARLES MO	636-441-0200	\$ 9,243,897.35	R		
32-0289822	KOLB GRADING LLC SECTION 0003 HMA INTERSECTION 45/445	ST CHARLES MO	636-441-0200	\$ 841,212.69	R		
32-0289822	KOLB GRADING LLC SECTION 0004 PCCP INTERSECTION 45/445	ST CHARLES MO	636-441-0200	\$ 898,667.28	R		
32-0289822	KOLB GRADING LLC SECTION 0005 COMMON ITEMS	ST CHARLES MO	636-441-0200	\$ 64,924,981.73	R		B = \$ 1,050,000.00

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF December 21, 2011

PAGE: 1B
 DATE: 01/04/12

CONTRACT IR-33737-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500448 DBE GOAL: 7.00
 DESCRIPTION: NEW INTERSTATE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 88,750,000.00 (A + B)
 CALL: 171 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM SR 45 TO SR 54, ON SR 54 TO CARMICHAEL ROAD
 AND AT THE INTERSECTION OF SR 45, SR 445 AND CONNECTOR
 COUNTY: GREENE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC SECTION 0001 HMA MAINLINE	BLOOMINGTON IN	812-336-4452	NO BID			
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC SECTION 0002 PCCP MAINLINE	BLOOMINGTON IN	812-336-4452	\$ 8,917,267.8	R		
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC SECTION 0003 HMA INTERSECTION 45/445	BLOOMINGTON IN	812-336-4452	\$ 815,169.95	R		
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC SECTION 0004 PCCP INTERSECTION 45/445	BLOOMINGTON IN	812-336-4452	\$ 977,645.11	R		
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC SECTION 0005 COMMON ITEMS	BLOOMINGTON IN	812-336-4452	\$ 73,457,145.36	R		B = \$ 500,000.00
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP SECTION 0001 HMA MAINLINE	COLUMBUS IN	812-579-5248	NO BID			
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP SECTION 0002 PCCP MAINLINE	COLUMBUS IN	812-579-5248	\$ 9,127,886.10	R	X	AWARD DBE 7.03%
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP SECTION 0003 HMA INTERSECTION 45/445	COLUMBUS IN	812-579-5248	\$ 828,599.19	R	X	AWARD
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP SECTION 0004 PCCP INTERSECTION 45/445	COLUMBUS IN	812-579-5248	NO BID			
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP SECTION 0005 COMMON ITEMS	COLUMBUS IN	812-579-5248	\$ 64,210,734.60	R	X	AWARD B = \$ 1,000,000.00
35-2040801	GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0001 HMA MAINLINE	CLARKSVILLE IN	812-282-1349	NO BID			
35-2040801	GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0002 PCCP MAINLINE	CLARKSVILLE IN	812-282-1349	\$ 9,981,421.25	R		
35-2040801	GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0003 HMA INTERSECTION 45/445	CLARKSVILLE IN	812-282-1349	\$ 843,743.19	R		
35-2040801	GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0004 PCCP INTERSECTION 45/445	CLARKSVILLE IN	812-282-1349	NO BID			
35-2040801	GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0005 COMMON ITEMS	CLARKSVILLE IN	812-282-1349	\$ 75,806,556.16	R		B = \$ 3,375,000.00

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF December 21, 2011

PAGE: 1C
 DATE: 01/04/12

CONTRACT IR-33737-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500448 DBE GOAL: 7.00
 DESCRIPTION: NEW INTERSTATE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 88,750,000.00 (A + B)
 CALL: 171 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM SR 45 TO SR 54, ON SR 54 TO CARMICHAEL ROAD
 AND AT THE INTERSECTION OF SR 45, SR 445 AND CONNECTOR
 COUNTY: GREENE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
36-3543170	T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0001 HMA MAINLINE	JOLIET IL	815-726-7722	NO BID			
36-3543170	T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0002 PCCP MAINLINE	JOLIET IL	815-726-7722	\$ 9,816,908.92	R		
36-3543170	T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0003 HMA INTERSECTION 45/445	JOLIET IL	815-726-7722	\$ 844,746.26	R		
36-3543170	T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0004 PCCP INTERSECTION 45/445	JOLIET IL	815-726-7722	NO BID			
36-3543170	T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0005 COMMON ITEMS	JOLIET IL	815-726-7722	\$ 68,841,462.23	R		B = \$ 875,000.00

NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF FOLLOWING COMBINATIONS OF SECTION BIDS, CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUES OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE, AND TIME (PART "B"):
 SECTION 0001, SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0005; OR
 SECTION 0001, SECTION 0004, AND SECTION 0005; OR
 SECTION 0002, SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0005; OR
 SECTION 0002, SECTION 0004, AND SECTION 0005.

THE LOWEST RANKING AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0002 + PVFM 0002 + SECTION 0003 + PVFM 0003 + SECTION 0005 + PART "B"
 =\$9,127,886.10 + \$10,025,048.71 + \$828,599.19 + \$1,080,430.32 + \$64,210,734.60 + \$1,000,000.00 = \$74,167,219.89
 AWARDED CONTRACT AMOUNT = \$73,167,219.89

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF December 21, 2011

PAGE: 2
 DATE: 01/10/12

CONTRACT R -30977-A
 CALL: 265

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710993
 DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, BIKE/PEDESTRIAN FACILITY
 ROUTE:
 LOCATION: ON THE BIG FOUR RAILROAD BRIDGE APPROACH AND ON
 MULBERRY STREET FROM RIVERSIDE DRICE TO MARKET STREET
 COUNTY: CLARK
 BIDDER

DBE GOAL: 4.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II	CROWN POINT Indiana	219-661-2450	\$ 12,233,625.79	R		REJECTED *
35-1128289	BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC	BOGGSTOWN Indiana	317-835-2254	\$ 13,480,583.58	R		REJECTED *
35-1385672	FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-372-8441	\$ 13,523,877.99	R		REJECTED *
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	\$ 13,000,000.00	R		REJECTED *
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 12,661,340.32	R		REJECTED *
35-1878024	RAGLE INC	NEWBURGH Indiana	812-853-9558	\$ 13,551,842.14	R		REJECTED *
35-2040801	GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	\$ 12,285,000.00	R		REJECTED *
61-0729748	HAYDON BRIDGE COMPANY	SPRINGFIELD Kentucky	859-336-7533	\$ 14,120,284.80	R		IRREGULAR**

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - REJECTED, TO BE RESCOPEED AND READVERTISED.

**FAILED TO SUBMIT A PERFORMANCE BOND WITH THE BID. BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A)(1)